
Words and Explanations

Lesson 14

accommodate (uh KOM uh dayt) If 
you accommodate others, you give 
them what they need or want.

annex (AN ehks) When a place has 
been annexed, it has been taken over.

authoritative (uh THAWR uh TAY 
tihv) An authoritative person is 
powerful and knowledgeable.

conclusive (kuhn KLOO sihv) If 
something is conclusive, it is final or 
certain.

confine (kuhn FYN) A person who 
is confined to a place is kept from 
leaving it.

disgruntled (dihs GRUHN tuhld) If 
you are disgruntled, you are angry 
and dissatisfied.

embroil (ehm BROYL) If you are 
embroiled in something, you are 
mixed up in something bad, such as 
a fight.

impartiality (IHM pahr shee AL 
uh tee) Someone who acts with 
impartiality acts fairly and does not 
favor one side over another.

relevant (REHL uh vuhnt) If 
something is relevant, it is connected 
to what is being talked about at the 
time.

turmoil (TUR moyl) Things are in 
turmoil when they are confused and 
out of order.
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“ The language of friendship 

is not words but 

meanings.”—Henry David Thoreau


